BID RESULTS

BID #
BID DATE/ TIME

NUMBER OF BIDDERS

Bid 19-02 Sanitation Services

ORGANIZATION:
Twp of Green

12/6/19 9:00 A.M.

NAME OF BIDDER Waste M
ADDRESS
CITY, STATE, ZIP
CONTACT Tom Stang
TELEPHONE
EMAIL tstang@wm.com
INSURANCE REQUIRED FROM VENDOR - DATE RECEIVED 12/6
BID GUARANTEE X
CONSENT OF SURETY x
BIDDERS ACKNOWLEDGEMENT OF ADDENDA X
STOCKHOLDER DISCLOSURE X
IRAN CERT X
NON COLLUSION X
EXHIBIT A/B Advisory Advisory Advisory Advisory Advisory
AA302 /CEIR X
NEW JERSEY BRC X
EXPERIENCE AND QUALIFICATIONS
PERFORMANCE BOND
EQUIPMENT CERT X
Bidder's certificate of public convenience and necessity
and an approval letter issued in conformance with N.J.S.
A 13:1E-126; X
VEHICLE DEDICATION AFFIDAVIT
NAME OF BIDDER Waste Management
OPTION # BULK PICKUP YEAR 1 YEAR 2 YEAR 3 YEAR 4 YEAR 5 SUM
SOLID WASTE COLLECTION 1 TIME
1 PER WEEK THURSDAYS Y $195,600.00 $195,600.00 $391,200.00
SOLID WASTE COLLECTION 1 TIME
2 PER WEEK THURSDAYS N $188,100.00 $188,100.00 $376,200.00
CURBSIDE RECYCLING PICKUP
3 SINGLE STREAM $114,600.00 $114,600.00 $229,200.00
CURBSIDE RECYCLING PICKUP
4 COMMINGLED RECYCLI NO BID NO BID $0.00
5 BULK PICKUP MONTHLY $195,600.00 $195,600.00 $391,200.00
6 QUARTERLY BULK PICKUP $195,600.00 $195,600.00 $391,200.00
7 CONTAINER PULLS ALL YEARS $19,656.00 $19,656.00 $39,312.00
OPTION #A (3 YEARS) BULK PICKUP YEAR 1 YEAR 2 YEAR 3 YEAR 4 YEAR 5 $0.00
SOLID WASTE COLLECTION 1 TIME
1A PER WEEK THURSDAYS Y $198,000.00 $198,000.00 $198,000.00 $594,000.00
SOLID WASTE COLLECTION 1 TIME
2A PER WEEK THURSDAYS N $190,500.00 $190,500.00 $190,500.00 $571,500.00
CURBSIDE RECYCLING PICKUP
3A SINGLE STREAM $115,950.00 $115,950.00 $115,950.00 $347,850.00
CURBSIDE RECYCLING P! UP
4A COMMINGLED RECYC NO BID NO BID NO BID $0.00
5A BULK PICKUP MOR LY $198,000.00 $198,000.00 $198,000.00 $594,000.00
6A QUARTERLY BULK PICKUP $198,000.00 $198,000.00 $198,000.00 $594,000.00
7A CONTAINER PULLS ALL YEARS $19,656.00 $19,656.00 $19,656.00 $58,968.00




OPTION #B (4 YEARS) BULK PICKUP YEAR 1 YEAR 2 YEAR 3 YEAR 4 YEAR 5 $0.00

SOLID WASTE COLLECTION 1 TIME

1B PER WEEK THURSDAYS Y $200,550.00 $200,550.00 $200,550.00 $200,550.00 $802,200.00
SOLID WASTE COLLECTION 1 TIME

2B PER WEEK THURSDAYS N $193,050.00 $193,050.00 $193,050.00 $193,050.00 $772,200.00
CURBSIDE RECYCLING PICKUP

3B SINGLE STREAM $117,450.00 $117,450.00 $117,450.00 $117,450.00 $469,800.00
CURBSIDE RECYCLING PICKUP

4B COMMINGLED RECYCLING NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $0.00

5B BULK PICKUP MONTHLY $200,550.00 $200,550.00 $200,550.00 $200,550.00 $802,200.00

6B QUARTERLY BULK PICKUP $200,550.00 $200,550.00 $200,550.00 $200,550.00 $802,200.00

7B CONTAINER PULLS ALL YEARS $19,656.00 $19,656.00 $19,656.00 $19,656.00 $78,624.00

OPTION #C (5 YEARS) BULK PICKUP YEAR 1 YEAR 2 YEAR 3 YEAR 4 YEAR 5 $0.00

SOLID WASTE COLLECTION 1 TIME

1Cc PER WEEK THURSDAYS Y $203,100.00 $203,100.00 $203,100.00 $203,100.00 $203,100.00 | $1,015,500.00
SOLID WASTE COLLECTION 1 TIME

2C PER WEEK THURSDAYS N $195,600.00 $195,600.00 $195,600.00 $195,600.00 $195,600.00 $978,000.00
CURBSIDE RECYCLING PICKUP

3C SINGLE STREAM $118,800.00 $118,800.00 $118,800.00 $118,800.00 $118,800.00 $594,000.00
CURBSIDE RECYCLING PICKUP

4C COMMINGLED RECYCLING NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $0.00

5C BULK PICKUP MONTHLY $203,100.00 $203,100.00 $203,100.00 $203,100.00 $203,100.00 | $1,015,500.00

6C QUARTERLY BULK PICKUP $203,100.00 $203,100.00 $203,100.00 $203,100.00 $203,100.00 | $1,015,500.00

7C CONTAINER PULLS ALL YEARS $19,656.00 $19,656.00 $19,656.00 $19,656.00 $19,656.00 $98,280.00




