BID RESULTS

BID #
BID DATE/ TIME

NUMBER OF BIDDERS

Re- Bid 19R-02 Sanitation
Services

ORGANIZATION:

Twp of Green

1/30/2020 3:00 p.m.

NAME OF BIDDER
ADDRESS
CITY, STATE, ZIP
CONTACT
TELEPHONE
EMAIL
INSURANCE REQUIRED FROM VENDOR - DATE RECEIVED

Waste Management

Blue Diamond Disposal

107 Silvia St 5 Howard Blvd
Ewing, NJ 08628 Mt Arlington NJ 07856
Tom Stang John Shortino

973-598-9800

tstang@wm.com

custsvc@bluediamonddisposal.com

BID GUARANTEE X X
CONSENT OF SURETY X X
BIDDERS ACKNOWLEDGEMENT OF ADDENDA X X
STOCKHOLDER DISCLOSURE X X
IRAN CERT X X
NON COLLUSION X X
EXHIBIT A/B Adyvisory Adyvisory
AA302 /CEIR X X
NEW JERSEY BRC X X
EXPERIENCE AND QUALIFICATIONS X X
PERFORMANCE BOND

EQUIPMENT CERT X X
Bidder's certificate of public convenience and necessity and an

approval letter issued in conformance with N.J.S.A. 13:1E-126; X X

VEHICLE DEDICATION AFFIDAVIT

NAME OF BIDDER

Waste Management

Blue Diamond Disposal

OPTION #1 Per Year Per Year
1 SOLID WASTE COLLECTION 1 TIME PER WEEK THURSDAYS -2 years $208,964.00 no bid
1A SOLID WASTE COLLECTION 1 TIME PER WEEK THURSDAYS - 3 years $211,560.00 no bid
1B SOLID WASTE COLLECTION 1 TIME PER WEEK THURSDAYS - 4 years $214,306.00 $185,000.00
1C SOLID WASTE COLLECTION 1 TIME PER WEEK THURSDAYS - 5 years $217,054.00 $177,000.00
Total Cost Total Cost
1 SOLID WASTE COLLECTION 1 TIME PER WEEK THURSDAYS -2 years $417,928.00 $0.00
1A SOLID WASTE COLLECTION 1 TIME PER WEEK THURSDAYS - 3 years $634,680.00 $0.00
1B SOLID WASTE COLLECTION 1 TIME PER WEEK THURSDAYS - 4 years $857,224.00 $740,000.00
1C SOLID WASTE COLLECTION 1 TIME PER WEEK THURSDAYS - 5 years $1,085,270.00 $885,000.00
OPTION #2 Per Year Per Year
2 CURBSIDE RECYCLING PICKUP SINGLE STREAM - 2 years $122,448.00 no bid
2a CURBSIDE RECYCLING PICKUP SINGLE STREAM - 3 years $123,994.00 no bid
2b CURBSIDE RECYCLING PICKUP SINGLE STREAM - 4 years $125,470.00 $106,000.00
2¢ CURBSIDE RECYCLING PICKUP SINGLE STREAM - 5 years $126,994.00 $102,000.00
Total Cost Total Cost
2 CURBSIDE RECYCLING PICKUP SINGLE STREAM - 2 years $244,896.00 $0.00
2a CURBSIDE RECYCLING PICKUP SINGLE STREAM - 3 years $371,982.00 $0.00
2b CURBSIDE RECYCLING PICKUP SINGLE STREAM - 4 years $501,880.00 $424,000.00
2¢ CURBSIDE RECYCLING PICKUP SINGLE STREAM - 5 years $634,970.00 $510,000.00
OPTION #3 Per Year Per Year
3 CONTAINER PULLS - 2 years $20,640.00 no bid
3a CONTAINER PULLS - 3 years $20,640.00 no bid




3b CONTAINER PULLS - 4 years $21,672.00 $21,000.00

3¢ CONTAINER PULLS - 5 years $22,755.00 $21,000.00
Total Cost Total Cost

3 CONTAINER PULLS - 2 years $41,280.00 $0.00

3a CONTAINER PULLS - 3 years $61,920.00 $0.00

3b CONTAINER PULLS - 4 years $86,688.00 $84,000.00

3¢ CONTAINER PULLS - 5 years $113,775.00 $105,000.00




